

**BID 2018-002
CULVERTS**

	Morrison Supply price per linear ft.	Ferguson Waterworks price per linear ft.	National Wholesale Supply price per linear ft.	Hayes Pipe price per linear ft.	2nd Coburn's Supply price per linear ft.	1st Wilson culverts price per linear ft.	Del Zotto price per linear ft.
BASE BID "A" Corrugated Steel Pipe							
15 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe	no bid	\$11.75	no bid	no bid	\$9.25	\$8.55	no bid
18 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe	no bid	\$14.55	no bid	no bid	\$11.56	\$10.23	no bid
24 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe	no bid	\$18.80	no bid	no bid	\$14.66	\$13.61	no bid
30 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe	no bid	\$24.00	no bid	no bid	\$18.52	\$17.05	no bid
36 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe	no bid	\$35.30	no bid	no bid	\$22.39	\$20.63	no bid
42 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe	no bid	\$41.20	no bid	no bid	\$26.24	\$23.84	no bid
48 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe	no bid	\$47.00	no bid	no bid	\$29.35	\$32.75	no bid
54 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe	no bid	\$53.40	no bid	no bid	\$38.66	\$36.85	no bid
60 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe	no bid	\$59.30	no bid	no bid	\$42.52	\$40.48	no bid
66 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe	no bid	\$89.80	no bid	no bid	\$51.02	\$44.52	no bid
72 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe	no bid	\$97.80	no bid	no bid	\$56.14	\$48.57	no bid
78 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe	no bid	\$105.90	no bid	no bid	\$60.38	\$52.34	no bid
84 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe	no bid	\$113.85	no bid	no bid	\$79.96	\$67.38	no bid
90 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe	no bid	\$121.85	no bid	no bid	\$85.08	\$72.09	no bid
96 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe	no bid	\$129.90	no bid	no bid	\$91.03	\$76.81	no bid
108 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe	no bid	\$146.80	no bid	no bid	\$140.40	\$116.79	no bid
120 in. Corrugated Steel Pipe	no bid	\$288.30	no bid	no bid	\$162.84	\$129.17	no bid
Total Base Bid "A"		\$1,399.50			\$940.00	\$811.66	
Asphalt Coating	no bid	50%	no bid	no bid	\$0.25 per in. dia.	no bid	no bid
Polymer Coating	no bid	50%	no bid	no bid	25%	40%	no bid
Alum. Steel Coating Type 2	no bid	15%	no bid	no bid	15%	20%	no bid
BASE BID "B" Corrugated (smooth interior wall) Polyethylene Pipe							
	2nd				1st		
15 in. polyethylene pipe	\$7.89	\$8.90	\$8.23	\$9.11	\$7.87	no bid	no bid
18 in. polyethylene pipe	\$11.09	\$11.70	\$11.57	\$12.80	\$11.07	no bid	no bid
24 in. polyethylene pipe	\$16.90	\$20.45	\$17.62	\$19.49	\$16.88	no bid	no bid
30 in. polyethylene pipe	\$26.08	\$27.65	\$27.19	\$30.07	\$26.05	no bid	no bid
36 in. polyethylene pipe	\$34.26	\$37.70	\$35.73	\$39.52	\$34.24	no bid	no bid
42 in. polyethylene pipe	\$44.10	\$48.00	\$46.00	\$50.87	\$44.09	no bid	no bid
48 in. polyethylene pipe	\$52.95	\$62.85	\$55.26	\$61.11	\$52.97	no bid	no bid
15 in. polyethylene coupling	\$13.10	\$22.30	\$14.32	\$16.00	\$9.55	no bid	no bid
18 in. polyethylene coupling	\$21.98	\$29.40	\$24.41	\$27.00	\$15.15	no bid	no bid
24 in. polyethylene coupling	\$31.02	\$57.75	\$34.42	\$38.00	\$21.30	no bid	no bid
30 in. polyethylene coupling	\$72.10	\$74.10	\$80.02	\$88.00	\$49.46	no bid	no bid
36 in. polyethylene coupling	\$90.54	\$141.15	\$107.19	\$122.00	\$68.85	no bid	no bid
42 in. polyethylene coupling	\$147.81	\$164.65	\$162.95	\$179.00	\$100.81	no bid	no bid
Total Base Bid "B"	\$569.82	\$706.60	\$624.91	\$692.97	\$458.29		
BASE BID "C" Reinforced Concrete Pipe							
		2nd					1st
15 in. rein. concrete pipe	no bid	\$18.25	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$15.10
18 in. rein. concrete pipe	no bid	\$22.50	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$18.60
24 in. rein. concrete pipe	no bid	\$33.40	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$28.00
30 in. rein. concrete pipe	no bid	\$57.45	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$42.50
36 in. rein. concrete pipe	no bid	\$66.60	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$54.99
42 in. rein. concrete pipe	no bid	\$94.45	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$78.00
48 in. rein. concrete pipe	no bid	\$112.65	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$93.00
Total BASE BID "C"		\$405.30					\$330.19
BASE BID "D" Reinforced Concrete Pipe FOB Place of Manufacturer							
		2nd					1st
15 in. rein. concrete pipe	no bid	\$17.85	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$14.75
18 in. rein. concrete pipe	no bid	\$21.80	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$18.00
24 in. rein. concrete pipe	no bid	\$32.65	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$27.00
30 in. rein. concrete pipe	no bid	\$50.25	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$41.50
36 in. rein. concrete pipe	no bid	\$65.15	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$53.80
42 in. rein. concrete pipe	no bid	\$91.75	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$75.75
48 in. rein. concrete pipe	no bid	\$111.20	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$91.80
Total BASE BID "D"		\$398.65					\$322.60